

**Ethan Ramirez**  
All time in hours

Date	Task Description	General Course Time		Project Time		Total Course Time
		Task	Total	Task	Total	
9/19/2014	Fri. Meeting at Montessori	0.0	0.0	1.0	1.0	1.0
9/20/2014	Individual Research	0.0	0.0	0.5	1.5	1.5
9/21/2014	Timesheet #1	0.5	0.5	0.0	1.5	2.0
9/24/2014	Group Meeting	0.0	0.5	1.0	2.5	3.0
9/24/2014	Research Lit Review	0.0	0.5	1.0	3.5	4.0
9/25/2014	Lit Review	0.0	0.5	1.0	4.5	5.0
9/28/2014	Lit Review	0.0	0.5	2.0	6.5	7.0
9/28/2014	Word #1	1.0	1.5	0.0	6.5	8.0
9/28/2014	Excel #2	1.0	2.5	0.0	6.5	9.0
9/29/2014	Lit Review	0.0	2.5	2.0	8.5	11.0
9/30/2014	Revise Lit Review	0.0	2.5	1.0	9.5	12.0
10/1/2014	Group Meeting - Revise	0.0	2.5	1.5	11.0	13.5
10/3/2014	Group Meeting Problem Analysis	0.0	2.5	1.0	12.0	14.5
10/3/2014	Group Meeting Gantt Chartt	0.0	2.5	1.0	13.0	15.5
10/4/2014	Problem Analysis Intros	0.0	2.5	1.0	14.0	16.5
10/5/2014	Lit Review Fix	0.0	2.5	0.5	14.5	17.0
10/5/2014	ACAD #1	2.0	4.5	0.0	14.5	19.0
10/5/2014	Timesheet #2	0.8	5.3	0.0	14.5	19.8
10/8/2014	Group Meeting - Solution Brainstorming	0.0	5.3	1.0	15.5	20.8
10/10/2014	Client Meeting - Criteria	0.0	5.3	0.6	16.1	21.4
10/10/2014	Group Meeting Alt. Solutions	0.0	5.3	1.0	17.1	22.4
10/11/2014	Alternative Solutions Write Up	0.0	5.3	2.0	19.1	24.4
10/12/2014	Formatting with Word #2	0.8	6.0	0.0	19.1	25.1
10/12/2014	ACAD #2	1.5	7.5	0.0	19.1	26.6
10/12/2014	Alternative Solution Diagrams	0.0	7.5	2.5	21.6	29.1
10/15/2014	Group Meeting - Criteria Define	0.0	7.5	1.0	22.6	30.1
10/16/2014	Midterm Peer Evaluation	0.7	8.2	0.0	22.6	30.8
10/17/2014	Client Meeting - Decision	0.0	8.2	1.0	23.6	31.8
10/18/2014	Final Decision	0.0	8.2	1.0	24.6	32.8
10/19/2014	Section IV Memo	0.0	8.2	1.0	25.6	33.8
10/19/2014	Timesheet #3	0.5	8.7	0.0	25.6	34.3
10/24/2014	Research - Sand-Rock Filtration	0.0	8.7	0.5	26.1	34.8
10/30/2014	Brainstorming - Pond Liner	0.0	8.7	0.3	26.4	35.1
10/30/2014	Literature Review Editiing	0.0	8.7	0.8	27.1	35.8
10/31/2014	Materials Gathering - Cinderblocks	0.0	8.7	3.0	30.1	38.8
11/4/2014	Materials Gathering - Cinderblocks	0.0	8.7	0.8	30.9	39.6
11/7/2014	Group Meeting - Section V	0.0	8.7	2.0	32.9	41.6
11/7/2014	Timesheet #4	0.7	9.4	0.0	32.9	42.3
11/8/2014	AutoCad #3	1.8	11.2	0.0	32.9	44.0
11/12/2014	Presentation Practice	0.0	11.2	1.0	33.9	45.0
11/15/2014	Section V - Specifications	0.0	11.2	2.5	36.4	47.5
11/15/2014	Foundation Building	0.0	11.2	2.0	38.4	49.5
11/15/2014	Appropedia First Draft	0.0	11.2	2.5	40.9	52.0
11/16/2014	Appropedia First Draft	0.0	11.2	4.0	44.9	56.0
11/21/2014	Appropedia Second Draft	0.0	11.2	2.0	46.9	58.0
12/3/2014	Ethics	1.0	12.2	0.0	46.9	59.0
12/7/2014	Final Appropedia Page	0.0	12.2	2.0	48.9	61.0
12/9/2014	Final Appropedia Page	0.0	12.2	1.0	49.9	62.0
12/9/2014	Final Timesheet	0.5	12.7	0.0	49.9	62.5