

Jonathan Lee

All Time in Hours

Date	Course Description	General Course Time		Project Time		Total Course Time
		Task	Total	Task	Total	
2/14/19	Team Brainstorming	0.0	0.0	1.0	1.0	1.0
2/14/19	Trello Assignment	0.0	0.0	0.3	1.3	1.3
2/15/19	Contact with Client	0.0	0.0	0.1	1.4	1.4
2/16/19	Team Meeting with Client	0.0	0.0	1.0	2.4	2.4
2/16/19	Design Brainstorming	0.0	0.0	0.2	2.6	2.6
2/16/19	Draft Document Outline	0.0	0.0	1.0	3.6	3.6
2/16/19	Timesheet #1	0.5	0.5	0.0	3.6	4.1
2/17/19	Team Contract	0.0	0.5	0.3	3.9	4.4
2/17/19	Timesheet #1	0.5	1.0	0.0	3.9	4.9
2/18/19	Draft Document Outline	0.0	1.0	0.2	4.1	5.1
2/18/19	Team Contract	0.0	1.0	0.3	4.4	5.4
2/21/19	Team Meeting	0.0	1.0	2.0	6.4	7.4
2/23/19	Interview with Client	0.0	1.0	1.0	7.4	8.4
2/24/19	Excel #2	1.0	2.0	0.0	7.4	9.4
2/24/19	Formatting with Word #1	1.5	3.5	0.0	7.4	10.9
2/24/19	Section 2 - Literature Review	0.0	3.5	2.0	9.4	12.9
2/25/19	Section 2 - Literature Review	0.0	3.5	2.5	11.9	15.4
2/26/19	Section 2 - Literature Review	0.0	3.5	2.0	13.9	17.4
2/27/19	Peer Review	0.0	3.5	1.0	14.9	18.4
2/28/19	Team Meeting	0.0	3.5	1.0	15.9	19.4
3/2/19	Meeting with Client	0.0	3.5	0.7	16.6	20.1
3/3/19	Timesheet #2	0.2	3.7	0.0	16.6	20.3
3/3/19	Section 2 - Problem Analysis	0.0	3.7	1.0	17.6	21.3
3/5/19	Team Meeting	0.0	3.7	1.0	18.6	22.3
3/9/19	Meeting with Client	0.0	3.7	0.6	19.2	22.9
3/10/19	Formatting with Word #2	1.0	4.7	0.6	19.8	24.5
3/12/19	Section 3 - Alternative Solutions	0.0	4.7	0.5	20.3	25.0

3/13/19	Section 3 - Alternative Solutions	0.0	4.7	1.0	21.3	26.0
3/13/19	Midterm Team Evaluations	1.0	5.7	0.0	21.3	27.0
3/14/19	Team Meeting	0.0	5.7	1.0	22.3	28.0
3/17/19	Timesheet #3	0.2	5.9	0.0	22.3	28.2
3/23/19	Section 4 - Decision	0.0	5.9	0.8	23.1	29.0
3/24/19	First Prototype Photos and Writing	0.0	5.9	1.0	24.1	30.0
3/28/19	CAD #1 (AutoCAD tutorials)	1.0	6.9	0.0	24.1	31.0
3/30/19	Short Meeting with Client	0.3	7.2	0.4	24.5	31.7
3/30/19	Timesheet #4	0.3	7.5	0.0	24.5	32.0
4/1/19	Building Second Prototype	0.0	7.5	1.0	25.5	33.0
4/1/19	Second Prototype Photos & Writing	0.0	7.5	0.8	26.3	33.8
4/5/19	Team Meeting at Library	0.0	7.5	0.6	26.9	34.4
4/6/19	Team Meeting with Client	0.0	7.5	0.7	27.6	35.1
4/11/19	Presentation Meeting	1.0	8.5	0.0	27.6	36.1
4/14/19	Ethics Assignment	1.0	9.5	0.0	27.6	37.1
4/16/19	Section 5 - Specification	0.0	9.5	0.5	28.1	37.6
4/21/19	CAD Drawing of model	1.2	10.7	0.0	28.1	38.8
4/24/19	Practice Presentation Powerpoint	0.0	10.7	1.0	29.1	39.8
4/27/19	Draft Appropedia Outline	0.5	11.2	0.0	29.1	40.3
4/29/19	Draft Poster	2.5	13.7	0.0	29.1	42.8
5/1/19	Final Presentation Powerpoint	1.5	15.2	0.0	29.1	44.3
5/4/19	Final Poster	2.2	17.4	0.0	29.1	46.5
5/5/19	Final Document	1.5	18.9	0.0	29.1	48.0
5/8/19	Final Timeline	0.6	19.5	0.0	29.1	48.6
5/8/19	Finishing Construction	0.0	19.5	3.5	32.6	52.1
5/9/19	Final Appropedia Page	1.2	20.7	0.0	32.6	53.3

